
 

 

Thursday, 12 October 2023 

BUILDING NEW HOMES FOR THE FUTURE OF VICTORIA 

The Allan and Albanese Labor Governments are building more homes for Victorians, creating a blueprint for the 
long-term renewal of the Banksia Gardens neighbourhood in Broadmeadows.  

The second project to be announced in Victoria as part of the Albanese Government’s Social Housing Accelerator, 
an investment of more than $80 million through the Accelerator and the Allan Labor Government’s Big Housing 
Build will deliver 120 new social homes for those who need them most. 

Built on vacant land facing Coleraine Street, the new homes will be modern, comfortable and energy-efficient – 
located close to shops, transport, schools and services in the heart of Broadmeadows. 

The ground floor of the new housing development will include new facilities to support both future residents and 
those who already live on the Banksia Gardens estate, as well as a new cycling and pedestrian link to connect the 
centre of Banksia Gardens to Coleraine Street with a nearby education precinct.  

Construction of new homes will get underway next year, and will create more than 700 local jobs.  

In addition to the new homes, the Allan Labor Government is creating a masterplan for the long-term renewal and 
improvements for the entire Banksia Gardens neighbourhood – making sure its homes, amenity and facilities 
remain fit-for-purpose for many years to come. 

The Social Housing Accelerator announced in June by the Albanese Government invests more than $496 million for 
Victoria alone to add 769 social homes to the state’s existing social housing stock.  

The Banksia Gardens redevelopment builds on the first Victorian Accelerator project, which will redevelop the 
Carlton public housing towers – replacing the 196 outdated, uninhabitable dwellings with 231 modern, energy 
efficient homes for Victorians, increasing housing on the site by at least 10 per cent. 

The Allan Labor Government is on track to deliver more than 12,000 much-needed new social and affordable homes 
through the Big Housing Build and create more than 40,000 jobs in construction.   

Quotes attributable to Prime Minister Anthony Albanese 

“The Social Housing Accelerator is real dollars, driving real change and building more homes for Australians.” 

“I was in Victoria a few weeks ago talking about a new Commonwealth funded social housing project in Carlton. 
Now we’re announcing another 120 social homes to be built in Broadmeadows.” 

“This is the Allan Government and the Commonwealth working together to deliver more homes for Victorians.” 

“We have an ambitious housing agenda which includes the delivery of 30,000 social and affordable homes through 
our Housing Australia Future Fund.” 

Quote attributable to Victorian Premier Jacinta Allan 

“Every Victorian deserves a place to call home – and for many, it means so much more than a roof over their head. 
We’re not wasting a moment building the safe, modern social housing Victorians deserve.” 



 

 

Quote attributable to Federal Minister for Housing Julie Collins  

“We know Australia’s housing challenges are serious which is why we’re taking immediate action with our $2 billion 
Social Housing Accelerator. This new funding, and the homes we are announcing today, will mean more Australians 
have a safe and affordable place to call home.”  

Quote attributable to Victorian Minister for Housing Harriet Shing 

“We’re proud to work with the Albanese Government to drive the biggest housing reforms in Victoria’s history – 
with modern, energy efficient homes for people who need them in liveable and connected neighbourhoods.” 

Quote attributable to Federal Member for Calwell Maria Vamvakinou 

“I know people in my community are experiencing challenges finding a safe and secure place to call home, these 
120 new homes will make a significant difference.” 

Quote attributable to Victorian Member for Broadmeadows Kathleen Matthews-Ward 

“I’ve been working hard to make improvements for the wonderful people living at Banksia Gardens housing estate. 
This huge $80 million investment in Broadmeadows will build 120 new quality homes for people who need them 
most.” 
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